
 

JANUARY 23, 2023 
 The Board of Supervisors of Clinton County, Iowa, met. Present were Supervisors Irwin, Srp and George. 
Minutes of the previous meeting were read and approved. 

 

 9:00 A.M.  Review Correspondence and Claims          Call to Order – Pledge of Allegiance   

 9:15 A.M.  Formal Action & Motions                           Claims Approved Unanimously   

CONSENT AGENDA 
Resolutions 2023-23 through 2023-25 and two (2) Motions were approved on the Consent Agenda:  

RESOLUTION 2023-23 
WHEREAS, it is necessary to make certain changes in the status of employees of Clinton County, now 

 THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED by the Board of Supervisors of Clinton County, Iowa, that the following 
changes are made:  Accept the retirement of David Feuss (District 1 Sub Foreman), effective December 9, 2022. 
 

 Roll Call: George: Yes; Srp: Yes; Irwin: Yes.     Jim Irwin, Jr., Chairperson 
 

RESOLUTION 2023-24 
 WHEREAS, the Clinton County Attorney employed a full-time, temporary summer intern, Leighton Berridge, 
and his internship has come to an end; now 

THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED by the Clinton County Board of Supervisors that Leighton K. Berridge be 
removed from the County Attorney payroll as of January 17, 2023; and   
 BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the County Auditor be and is hereby authorized to discontinue biweekly 
pay warrants on the General Basic Fund without further action of this Board.    
 

 Roll Call: George: Yes; Srp: Yes; Irwin: Yes.     Jim Irwin, Jr., Chairperson 
 

RESOLUTION 2023-25 
BE IT RESOLVED by the Clinton County Board of Supervisors that Wapsi Oaks Country Club, has 

electronically filed a renewal application for a liquor license number with endorsements for Sunday Sales and Outdoor 
Sales, effective March 22, 2023, and that said local authority be and is hereby approved by the Clinton County Board 
of Supervisors. 

 

 Roll Call: George: Yes; Srp: Yes; Irwin: Yes.     Jim Irwin, Jr., Chairperson 
 

MOTION by Supervisor Srp to authorize the Chairperson to sign Utility Permit Number 6-33 for F&B 
Communications to place fiber optics cable along the roads 160th St, 182nd St, 190th St, 210th St, 280th Ave, 290th Ave, 
and 302nd Ave. In the county right-of-way located in the following sections and townships:  
 Township    Sections 
      DeWitt  19, 25, 29, 30 T82N R04E 
                 Bloomfield  25 and 30 T83N R03E 

             Waterford  30, 31, and 32 T83N R04E 
Washington  4, 5, 6, 7, 8, 9, 17, and 20 T82N R04E 
   Welton  1, 12, 13 T83N R03E 

  

 Roll Call: George: Yes; Srp: Yes; Irwin: Yes.     Motion carried. 
 

MOTION by Supervisor Srp to authorize the Chairperson to sign Utility Permit Number 16-209 for Windstream to 
place buried and/or aerial fiber optic along 285th Ave, 270th Ave, 262nd Ave, and 270th Street in the County right-of-
way located in sections 30 and 31 of T81N R4E and Sections 25, 26, 34, and 36 of T81 R3E in the DeWitt TWP. 
  

 Roll Call: George: Yes; Srp: Yes; Irwin: Yes.     Motion carried. 
 

 RESOLUTIONS 
The following resolution was presented and on motion approved:  

RESOLUTION 2023-26 
WHEREAS, Clinton County has negotiated terms and conditions of lease agreements between Clinton County 

and various non-profit entities for space in the Clinton County Administration Building, 1900 North Third St., 
Clinton; and  
 WHEREAS, the lease with Clinton Substance Abuse Council has been updated to add more office space; now  
 THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED by the Clinton County Board of Supervisors that said lease agreement dated 
January 23, 2023, be and are hereby approved and the Chairman be and is hereby authorized to sign said lease 
agreement with the Clinton Substance Abuse Council on behalf of Clinton County. 

 

Roll Call: George: Yes; Srp: Yes; Irwin: Yes.     Jim Irwin, Jr., Chairperson 
 

The following resolution was presented and on motion approved:  
RESOLUTION 2023-27 



 

WHEREAS, Iowa Code section 459.304(3) sets out the procedure if a Board of Supervisors wishes to adopt a 
“construction evaluation resolution” relating to the construction of a confinement feeding operation structure; and 
 WHEREAS, only counties that have adopted a construction evaluation resolution can submit to the 
Department of Natural Resources (DNR) an adopted recommendation to approve or disapprove a construction permit 
application regarding a proposed confinement feeding operation structure; and 
 WHEREAS, only counties that have adopted a construction evaluation resolution and submitted an adopted 
recommendation may contest the DNR’s decision regarding a specific application; and  
 WHEREAS, by adopting a construction evaluation resolution the Board of Supervisors agrees to evaluate 
every construction permit application for a proposed confinement feeding operation structure received by the Board of 
Supervisors between February 1, 2023, and January 31, 2024, and submit an adopted recommendation regarding that 
application to the DNR; and  
 WHEREAS,  the Board of Supervisors must conduct an evaluation of every construction permit application 
using the master matrix created in Iowa Code section 459.305, but the Board’s recommendation to the DNR may be 
based on the final score on the master matrix or may be based on reasons other than the final score on the master 
matrix; 
 NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED by the Clinton County Board of Supervisors that the Board of 
Supervisors hereby adopts this construction evaluation resolution pursuant to Iowa Code section 459.304(3). 

 

Roll Call: George: Yes; Srp: Yes; Irwin: Yes.     Jim Irwin, Jr., Chairperson 
 

The following resolution was presented and on motion approved:  
RESOLUTION 2023-28 

WHEREAS, the Clinton County Supervisors recognizes federal requirements in regard to juvenile detention; 
and 

WHEREAS, based on recommendations from the Clinton County Attorney and Clinton County Sheriff that 
outside juvenile detention is needed for Clinton County; now 
 THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED that the Clinton County Board of Supervisors authorizes the Clinton 
County Board of Supervisors Chairman to sign a six-month contract with Linn County, Iowa, for juvenile detention 
and diversion services.   

 

Roll Call: George: Yes; Srp: Yes; Irwin: Yes.     Jim Irwin, Jr., Chairperson 
 

The following resolution was presented and on motion approved:  
RESOLUTION 2023-29 

WHEREAS, the Clinton County Board of Supervisor has considered all the bids for the elevator project at the 
Clinton County Courthouse; and 
 WHEREAS, the bids received is as follows 
  Reed Construction  $296,929.00 
  Precision Builders, Inc $273,300.00 
  Tricon    $298,000.00 

THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED by the Board of Supervisors of Clinton County, Iowa, that  the bid be 
awarded to Precision Builders, Inc at the amount of $273,300.00 which is recommended by Clinton County Facilities 
Director Corey Johnson; and 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the Chairperson of the Board of Supervisors be authorized to execute sign 
proposal on behalf of Clinton County, Iowa. 

 

Roll Call: George: Yes; Srp: Yes; Irwin: Yes.     Jim Irwin, Jr., Chairperson 
 

Resolution 2023-30 discussion: Supervisor George prefers less blanket weed spraying to cut down on adverse effects 
to pollinators such as bees. She prefers spot spraying only. Chairman Irwin said there is a timing issue with spot 
spraying. County Engineer Todd Kinney said there is already a time when they are allowed to spot spray. Kinney said 
this plan has gone on for six years and the reasons they do this plan is because of complaints of weeds encroaching on 
private property. He said the County could go back to spot spraying. Supervisor Srp said he’s willing to spot spray, but 
acknowledged the current plan is working well. Srp said broadcast spraying has suppressed some of the noxious weed 
growth. Srp asked would there be follow up spot spray and Kinney said the County does do that now when reports are 
given to them.  

 

The following resolution was presented and on motion approved:  
RESOLUTION 2023-30 

 WHEREAS, the following quotations were received for Clinton County Secondary Road Department right-of-way 
weed spraying, and 



 

 
 
 
 

 THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED by the Board of Supervisors of Clinton County, Iowa, that the quote for 
roadside ROW spraying is awarded to: Brush and Weed Control Specialists (50% Blanket Spray and 50% Spot Spray 
Alternate) (Chemicals to be purchased by Clinton County) 

 

Roll Call: George: No; Srp: Yes; Irwin: Yes.     Jim Irwin, Jr., Chairperson 
 

Motion discussion: Chairman Irwin said there has been an outreach to the County to discuss negotiating a tax 
abatement on the former Ashford property in Clinton. He said he and County Auditor Eric Van Lancker and County 
Treasurer Dustin Johnson have been working with the developer to draft an agreement. Irwin said there is a little more 
than $1.3 million in tax liability and the agreement would abate taxes at an equal level of what is invested in 
improving the property. Irwin said if a developer does not take over the property than the County takes the property in 
a few months and would have to pay for the improvements or demolition. He said demolition could cost around $5 
million. Irwin said the utility bill for the property is also very high per month just to keep the property operational. 
Andy Sokolovich, Grow Clinton, commended the County for engaging in a development agreement to provide the 
County a safety net. He did ask the County to encourage the developer to use local resources. Akif Aydin, developer, 
said he will be in town next week to start meeting with local contractors about the timing of the project.  

 

MOTION by Supervisor Srp to authorize the Chairman to sign an engagement letter with Ahlers and Cooney, P.C. to 
prepare and advise on a development agreement. 
  

 Roll Call: George: Yes; Srp: Yes; Irwin: Yes.     Motion carried. 
 

 DEPARTMENT HEADS, ELECTED OFFICIALS AND EMPLOYEES 
Van Lancker reviewed the upcoming meeting schedule with the Board. He said the week features budget presentations 
on Wednesday and Friday and active shooter training on Thursday.  
Johnson reported there is a bill in Des Moines to address the cross-county titling of vehicles. 
Supervisor Srp said it sounds like the State may reduce the number of departments across the state and could impact 
the Department of Corrections locally. He said the local Seventh Judicial employees are not allowed to provide an 
opinion on the proposal.  
 

 DISCUSSION WITH POSSIBLE ACTION 
Cyber Security Insurance: Julie Bray, local ICAP insurance agent, explained cyber security was originally built into 
the ICAP policy and then removed as an extra to the policy. She said the premium is now $28,000 a year for a $1 
million coverage and the County also needs to meet certain cyber-security rules before they can issue the policy. She 
said the County is working on meeting those requirements. Van Lancker said the County currently has $20,000 
budgeted so a budget amendment may be needed and the amount for the next fiscal year will need to be adjusted up 
for the continued coverage.  
 

MOTION to approve the cyber security package as presented. 
 

Roll Call: George: Yes; Srp: Yes; Irwin: Yes.     Motion carried. 
 

Annual All-Systems Overweight Permit Routes in the County: County Engineer Todd Kinney reviewed the program 
for Clinton County. The County can identify roads to add to the program up to July 1, 2025. He said permits are $500 
each and issued state-wide. He said the money is pooled and dispersed to counties that have added roads to the list. 
Kinney thinks the County should add the minimum number of roads to the State to receive some of the state funds. 
Kinney will create a list of roads that connect to Highways 30 and 136 for consideration. Kinney doesn’t believe the 
Board needs to take action but will review what the next step includes.  
 

10:08 A.M.   Hometown Pride Update 
Hometown Pride County Coordinator, Francis Boggus, reviewed the annual report he provided to the Board. He said 
he will ask for the funding to be split 50-50 with the City of Clinton because it is typical to spend half his time in the 
City of Clinton. He said because of the split he is asking the County for a contribution of $20,000 for the next fiscal 
year.  

11:00 A.M.  Canvass of Votes from the Drainage District Elections 
The Board of Supervisors canvassed the votes for the Drainage District Elections from January 21, 2023. Results were 
placed on file in the County Auditor’s Office. 
 

Contractor Blanket Spray 
50% of east half 
centerline miles 
Total Cost (ALT) 

Spot Spray 50% 
of west half 
centerline miles 
Total Cost (ALT) 

Spot Spray 
All centerline 
miles Total 
Cost (ALT) 

Purchase 
Escort 
Per 
pound 

Purchase 
Milestone 
Per gallon 

B&W Control 
Specialists 

$29,500.00 $28,500.00 $57,000.00 $80.00 $345.00 

DBI Services No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
Crop Production 
Services 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 



 

 The Board of Supervisors approved the following claims be allowed and drafts issued on the various funds in 
payment thereof: 

Vendor Payable Description Payment Amount 
ACCESS SYSTEMS COPIER LEASE $13.58 
ACCESS SYSTEMS LEASING COPIER LEASE $247.82 
ADVANCED CORRECTIONAL HEALTHCARE INC SERVICES $16,583.04 
AGVANTAGE FS FUEL $73,433.83 
ALLIANT ENERGY / INTERSTATE LIGHT/POWER CO SERVICE $4,298.24 
ALTORFER INC PARTS $965.52 
AMAZON CAPITAL SERVICES INC EQUIPMENT/PARTS $594.09 
ANDOVER, CITY OF FARM TO MARKET $1,770.58 
ARAMARK CHICAGO LOCKBOX SERVICES $20,478.84 
ARCHIVESOCIAL SERVICES $3,137.40 
AREA SUBSTANCE ABUSE COUNCIL GRANT $1,083.83 
AT&T MOBILITY NATIONAL ACCOUNTS LLC SERVICE $1,879.06 
BALDWIN NASHVILLE TELEPHONE CO INC SERVICE $111.90 
BELLEVUE COMM SCHOOL DIST, LITTLE STARS PRESCHOOL SCHOLARSHIPS $400.00 
BICE, KRISTEN MEI SERVICES $204.90 
BILLION CHEVROLET BUICK GMC TOYOTA  VEHICLE MAINT $815.86 
BOOMHEADSHOT LLC RENT ASSISTANCE $275.00 
BOWMAN, DAVID M RAD OFFICER $210.00 
CALAMUS, CITY OF SERVICE $3,036.68 
CALHOUN-BURNS & ASSOCIATES INC SERVICE $328.80 
CAMANCHE, CITY OF - ROSE HILL CEMETERY SERVICEMEN'S GRAVE CARE $3,510.00 
CAMPBELL, PAUL WELL PLUGGING $500.00 
CARDINAL PRESCHOOL SCHOLARSHIPS $400.00 
CDW GOVERNMENT LLC PARTS $99.22 
CENTRAL IOWA JUVENILE DETENTION CENTER SERVICES $2,575.20 
CENTURYLINK SERVICE $4,543.34 
CENTURYLINK BUSINESS SERVICES SERVICE $115.11 
CERTASITE LLC MONTHLY FIRE MONITORING 

 
$660.00 

CHARLOTTE ELECTRICAL SERVICE INC PROJECT PAYMENT $1,983.61 
CHARLOTTE, CITY OF FARM TO MARKET $4,348.92 
CHARM-TEX INC SUPPLIES $2,366.40 
CHEMRIGHT LABORATORIES INC SUPPLIES $480.00 
CINTAS CORP NO 2 SHOP SUPPLIES $272.18 
CINTAS CORPORATION LOC 23M SHOP SUPPLIES $1,826.63 
CLINTON COUNTY COPY PAPER REIMB $38.00 
CLINTON COUNTY AREA SOLID WASTE AGENCY SERVICES $330.00 
CLINTON HERALD PUBLICATIONS $1,240.79 
CLINTON PROPERTIES LLC RENT ASSISTANCE $950.00 
CLINTON, CITY OF SEWER SERVICE $2,919.26 
CNH INDUSTRIAL CAPITAL PRODUCTIVITY PLUS PARTS $808.65 
COAST TO COAST COMPUTER PRODUCTS INC SUPPLIES $381.95 
CROSTHWAITE, MARGARET SUPPLIES $32.34 
CULLIGAN OF CLINTON WATER $611.30 
CYPRESS SOLUTIONS SERVICE $672.50 
DAVISON FUELS & OIL, LLC FUEL $4,549.94 
DEERING, ANDREA MEI SERVICES $172.44 
DELWOOD COMMUNITY PRESCHOOL SCHOLARSHIPS $600.00 
DEWITT, CITY OF SERVICE $265.15 
DM CORP PROJECT PAYMENT $147,563.05 
DOWNRANGE SHOOTING SUPPLY SUPPLIES $839.99 
DOWNTOWN AUTO CLINIC VEHICLE MAINT $499.14 
E J VOGGENTHALER CO PIPE BOLLARDS $1,544.24 
EAST CENTRAL INTERGOVERNMENTAL ASSOC 2ND INSTALLMENT $2,871.00 
EASTERN IOWA LIGHT & POWER COOP SERVICE $1,580.76 
EASTERN IOWA TIRE INC TIRES $2,409.60 
ECOLAB INC EQUIPMENT LEASE $163.01 
EHREDT, HANDY B MILEAGE REIMB $10.36 
ELWOOD CEMETERY ASSOCIATION SERVICEMEN'S GRAVE CARE $550.00 
F&B COMMUNICATIONS INC SERVICE $299.56 
FIDLAR TECHNOLOGIES SUPPLIES $179.70 
FOLEY, ASHLEY MEI SERVICES $891.83 
GENESIS OCCUPATIONAL HEALTH SERVICES $208.00 
GENESIS VNA & HOSPICE SERVICES $14,676.85 
GO GREEN CLEANING SERVICE SERVICES $200.00 
GOOSE LAKE, CITY OF FARM TO MARKET $2,386.73 
GRAND MOUND COOPERATIVE TELEPHONE ASSOC SERVICE $1,186.74 
GUARDIAN ALLIANCE TECHNOLOGIES INC LICENSE/SERVICES $62.00 
HARRIS, AMANDA C MEI SERVICES $91.08 
HARTZ LOCK CO SERVICE CALL $1,199.50 
HAWKEYE AREA COMMUNITY ACTION PROGRAM INC HEAD START EXPANDED $2,591.16 
HEALTH SOLUTIONS LLC WELLNESS PROGRAM $3,424.30 
HENDERSON PRODUCTS INC PARTS $536.71 
HILLCREST FAMILY SERVICES SERVICES $1,446.15 
HODGES, BRETT A MEI SERVICES $257.14 
HOFFMAN CONSTRUCTION LLC PROJECT PAYMENT $142,500.00 
HOME DEPOT CREDIT SERVICES MATERIALS/TOOLS $325.00 
I C S JAIL SUPPLIES INC EQUIPMENT $3,540.24 
IMAGETREND INC INTERFACE $2,089.60 
INNOCORP LTD SUPPLIES $2,590.61 
INTERNATIONAL ASSOC OF CHIEFS OF POLICE INC MEMBERSHIP $380.00 
INTERSTATE POWER SYSTEMS INC PARTS $677.70 
IOWA AMERICAN WATER CO SERVICE $384.00 
IOWA DEPT OF PUBLIC HEALTH SUPPLIES $142.45 
IOWA STATE ASSOCIATION OF ASSESSORS DUES $650.00 
IOWA STATE ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES REGISTRATION $620.00 
ITSAVVY LLC PARTS $2,935.00 
J & J AUTO GLASS LLC VEHCILE MAINT $325.00 
J & L ENTERPRISES SNOW REMOVAL $1,325.00 
JOHN DEERE FINANCIAL SUPPLIES/MATERIALS/PARTS $19.51 



 

KALFAS, DANIEL B GROUND LEASE $50.00 
KAMPER KORNER LLC PARTS $30.97 
KARL CHEVROLET INC VEHICLE MAINT $58,672.80 
KETELSEN, ALLEN R EXPENSE REIMB $203.25 
KUNAU IMPLEMENT CO INC PARTS $62.96 
LAURITZEN AUTOMOTIVE INC VEHICLE MAINT $49.09 
LECTRONICS INC MAINT FEE $517.50 
LEGISLATIVE SERVICES AGENCY SUPPLIES $850.00 
LEXIS-NEXIS SERVICES $249.00 
LIFE CONNECTIONS LC SERVICES $307.92 
LIGHTING MAINTENANCE INC SERVICE CALL $853.55 
LINN,  COUNTY OF - COMMUNITY SERVICES SERVICES $11,025.00 
LIVESAY, RODNEY MEI SERVICES $26.22 
LOST NATION, CITY OF FARM TO MARKET $2,639.96 
LOST NATION-ELWOOD TELEPHONE SERVICE $396.91 
LOW MOOR, CITY OF FARM TO MARKET $2,453.82 
MAGILL-HAMILTON, ANN E MEI SERVICES $124.20 
MAIL SERVICES LLC SERVICES $1,869.87 
MALCOM, MARY E MEI SERVICES $3,577.18 
MAQUOKETA RIVER WATERSHED MGNT AUTHORITY FINANCIAL COMMITMENT $3,531.00 
MARTIN EQUIPMENT OF ILLINOIS INC PARTS $850.50 
MARY'S ALTERATIONS & REPAIR SERVICES $171.50 
MASTERCARD JAN PAYMENT $9,934.44 
MAYBERRY, ELLEN C EXPENSE REIMB $212.13 
MCI COMMUNICATIONS SERVICES SERVICE $54.22 
MCMAHON, THOMAS REIMBURSEMENT $629.00 
MEDIACOM COMMUNICATIONS CORP SERVICE $4,600.00 
MEIER, RANDALL M MILEAGE REIMB $172.44 
MENARD INC PARTS $1,650.83 
MEYER PEST CONTROL LLC SERVICES $130.00 
MEYERMANN, SCOTT A MILEAGE REIMB $427.78 
MIDAMERICAN ENERGY COMPANY SERVICE $1,683.21 
MJ'S EAST AMOCO FUEL $1,614.96 
MODUS SERVICES $2,375.00 
MOTION INDUSTRIES INC PARTS $21.36 
MOTOROLA SOLUTIONS INC PARTS $3,242.94 
MULGREW OIL CO FUEL $6,264.76 
NAPA AUTO PARTS - 2725 PARTS $3,539.41 
NAPA AUTO PARTS - 2879 PARTS $108.46 
NAPA AUTO PARTS - 5580 PARTS $4.99 
NATIONAL ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES NACO MEMBERSHIP DUES $982.00 
NATIONAL SHERIFFS’ ASSOCIATION MEMBERSHIP $142.00 
NICHOLS, LORI MEAL REIMB $9.58 
NORTHWEST MECHANICAL INC SERVICE CONTRACT $1,642.50 
O'DONNELL ACE HARDWARE PARTS $406.56 
O'REILLY FIRST CALL PARTS $53.06 
ORIGIN DESIGN CO SERVICES $511.25 
OSSIAN INC CALCIUM CHLORIDE $11,373.20 
OUR SAVIOR'S LUTHERAN CEMETERY SERVICEMEN'S GRAVE CARE $430.00 
P & K MIDWEST INC PARTS $889.10 
PAPE FUNERAL HOME  INC CREMATION ASSISTANCE $1,500.00 
PINE HILL CEMETERY ASSOCIATION SERVICEMEN'S GRAVE CARE $510.00 
PLUNKETT'S PEST CONTROL INC SERVICES $356.06 
PRESTON READY MIX CORP ROCK $1,131.51 
PRESTON TELEPHONE COMPANY SERVICE $93.22 
PRICE, SHELLY J MEI SERVICES $17.94 
QUALITY INN SERVICES $350.00 
QUILL CORPORATION SUPPLIES $590.96 
R H A SERVICE INC EQUIPMENT LEASE $160.00 
RANDY'S NEIGHBORHOOD MARKET SUPPLIES $29.71 
RAY O'HERRON CO INC SUPPLIES $761.40 
RDO TRUCK CENTER CO PARTS $459.45 
RICOH USA INC COPIER LEASE $211.61 
RIVER VALLEY COOPERATIVE PROPANE $2,413.73 
RK DIXON COPIER MAINT $57.67 
RK GRAPHICS SIGNS $35.00 
RODEN, JOHNNY RENT ASSISTANCE $275.00 
ROGIS, DAVID GLEN MEI SERVICES $33.12 
SCHEMERS, KELLY T EXPENSE REIMB $7.47 
SCHNEIDER GEOSPATIAL LLC SERVICES $354.00 
SCHOENAUER, KENNETH F  P C SERVICES $170.00 
SCHULZ, ASHTON LEE MEI SERVICES $12.42 
SHI INTERNATIONAL CORP PARTS $21,164.89 
SIADSA SERVICES $2,220.00 
SIMMONS PERRINE MOYER BERGMAN PLC SERVICES $720.00 
SKYLINE CENTER INC SERVICES $378.75 
SMICKER, JODY MEI SERVICES $38.63 
SMITH, ANDREW RAD OFFICER $210.00 
SOENKSEN, ALLAN L MEAL REIMB $13.55 
SPAHN & ROSE LUMBER CO - 08 SUPPLIES $341.56 
ST MARY'S BRYANT CEMETERY SERVICEMEN'S GRAVE CARE $90.00 
STANKEE, CHRISTY MEI SERVICES $12.42 
STATE HYGIENIC LABORATORY SERVICES $210.00 
STERLING COMMERCIAL ROOFING INC REPAIR PROJECT $550.00 
STOREY KENWORTHY CORP SUPPLIES $134.00 
STREICHER'S SUPPLIES $2,737.54 
THE GARAGE INC VEHICLE MAINT $1,354.52 
THE OBSERVER PUBLICATION $944.32 
THEISEN'S OF DE WITT INC PARTS AND SUPPLIES $459.80 
THOMPSON TRUCK & TRAILER INC PARTS $412.99 
TIPTON ELECTRIC MOTORS INC PRESSURE WASHER $1,198.00 
TIRES N' MORE TIRES $26,407.50 
TORONTO, CITY OF FARM TO MARKET $901.70 



 

TOTAL SEPTIC SERVICE SERVICE $300.00 
TRANSUNION RISK & ALTERNATIVE DATA SOLUTIONS INC SERVICES $75.00 
TRI STOP FUEL FUEL $56.16 
TURNER ELECTRIC CO INC PARTS $129.98 
TW TRAINING SERVICES $1,375.00 
ULINE INC SUPPLIES $275.66 
US CELLULAR SERVICE $1,930.74 
VANGUARD APPRAISALS INC SERVICE $1,800.00 
VERIZON WIRELESS SERVICE $234.37 
VOLRATH HARDWOODS SUPPLIES $400.00 
WASHER SYSTEMS OF IOWA EQUIPMENT $3,100.00 
WELLS FARGO FINANCIAL LEASING INC COPIER LEASE $814.05 
WENDLING QUARRIES INC ROCK $24,566.98 
WILSON, RUTH A EXPENSE REIMB $69.98 
XEROX FINANCIAL SERVICES LLC COPIER LEASE $787.80 

 Grand Total: $760,859.15 
Fund Expense Amount  
0001  GENERAL BASIC $229,708.27  
0002  GENERAL SUPPLEMENTAL $18,317.11  
0003  AMERICAN RESCUE PLAN ACT OF 2021 (ARPA) $292,949.30  
0004  EASTERN IOWA MENTAL HEALTH REGION $708.22  
0011  RURAL SERVICES BASIC $25.42  
0020  SECONDARY ROADS $184,277.44  
0021  PIONEER CEMETERY $69.98  
0024  COUNTY RECORDER'S RECORDS MGMT $378.75  
0027  COMMISSARY $2,409.26  
0040  MISC. GRANTS $1,083.83  
4000  EMERGENCY MANAGEMENT SERVICES $4,189.54  
4010  E911 $8,259.07  
4100  COUNTY ASSESSOR $3,607.25  
5120  SCHOOL READY $11,242.28  
7300  REFUND CLEARING $105.00  
8500  CLINTON COUNTY BENEFIT TRUST $3,528.43  

Grand Total: $760,859.15  
 

 Roll Call: George: Yes; Srp: Yes; Irwin: Yes.     Motion carried. 
 

I, Eric Van Lancker, Clinton County Auditor, do hereby certify this to be a complete and accurate list of all claims 
presented to the Clinton County Board of Supervisors on this date. Signed: Eric Van Lancker, Clinton County Auditor 
 

The Board of Supervisors adjourned to meet on Wednesday, January 25, 2023. 
 

Eric Van Lancker, County Auditor       Jim Irwin, Jr., Chairperson 
 

-APPROVED- 
___________________________ ____________________________ 
County Auditor        Chairperson 


